

ST. JOSEPH COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION				
Dust Control				
Bid Opening March 23, 2020 @1:00 pm				
<u>Bidder</u>	<u>38%</u>	<u>38%</u>	<u>42%</u>	<u>42%</u>
	Price/Gal - Foot Solid App.	Price/Gal - Foot Spot App	Price/Gal - Foot Solid App.	Price/Gal - Foot Spot App
*Great Lakes Chloride, Inc.	\$0.652/gal or \$0.247/ft	\$125/hr Port to Port + \$0.652/gal, Min. 3 hrs.	\$0.695/gal or \$0.263/ft	\$125/hr Port to Port + \$0.695/gal, Min. 3 hrs.
324 Washington Ave.				
PO Box 6324				
Grand Haven, MI 49417-0634				
Afrantz@glchloride.com				
Zclothier@glchloride.com				
Ashley Frantz				
812-340-2323				
Zach Clothier				
574-527-0287				
Michigan Chloride	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
402 W.Jackson Road				
St. Louis, MI48880				
P: 800-286-7312				
Karen VanDooren (new contact as of 3/5/2020)				
kvandooren@michiganchloride.com				
Inserve	Mineral Well Brine	Mineral Well Brine		
514 E. Mraion St.	\$0.50/gal	\$0.50/gal		
Mishawaka, IN 46545				
P: 574.968.0372				
C: 574.532.1547				
F: 574.968.0373				
24 hr: 877.917.3239				
Thomas Lovisa				
tlovisa@inserve24-7.com				

* Indicates Bid Awarded To

* indicates bid awarded to				

* Indicates Bid Awarded To